NEW HEALTH AND SCIENCE BUILDING UNIVERSITY OF WISCONSIN - EAU CLAIRE EAU CLAIRE, WISCONSIN PROJECT NO. 19J4E-02 MEPID PROJECT MANAGER - KRISTINE ANDERSON

IDENTIFICATION OF SUCCESSFUL MEP BIDDERS April 11, 2024

CONTRACTOR	DIVISION OF WORK	BID AMOUNT
Hooper Corporation DeForest, WI	Fire Suppression Base Bid No. 2	1,474,690.00
Hooper Corporation DeForest, WI	Plumbing Base Bid No. 3	9,894,529.00
KBK Services, Inc. Ashland, WI	HVAC Base Bid No. 4	28,690,000.00
B & B Electric, Inc. Eau Claire, WI	Electrical Base Bid No. 5	17,506,500.00

1	BID FORM - MECHANICAL, ELECTRICAL, PLUMBING, AND FIRE PROTECTION (MEP)
2	(Rev1/2023)
3	DIVISION OF FACILITIES DEVELOPMENT
4	s.16.855 Wis. Stats.
5	
6	NEW HEALTH AND SCIENCE BUILDING
7	UNIVERSITY OF WISCONSIN – EAU CLAIRE
8	EAU CLAIRE, WISCONSIN
9	
10	Division Project No. 19J4E-02
11	Division Project No. 175415-02
12	
13	BID SUBMISSION DUE by 1:00PM, Mechanical, Electrical, Plumbing, and Fire Protection (MEP) Bid
14	Opening: 2:00 P.M., APRIL 4, 2024 - RESCHEDULED.
15	· F · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
16	To: State of Wisconsin, Department of Administration, Division of Facilities Development (a-joint-venture)-
17	(a corporation)
18	(a partnership)
19	We Hooper Corporation (a partition)
20	(Cross out inapplicable)
21	(Cross out mappineaoic)
22	
23	Of 6450 Pederson Crossing Blvd, DeForest, Dane, WI, 53532
24	
	Street City County State Zip
25	
26	hereby agree to execute a subcontract with the General Prime Contractor awarded the contract for the
27	project designated above and to furnish satisfactory separate 100% Performance Bond and 100% Payment
28	Bond in the amount specified no later than ten (10) days after execution of the subcontract with the
29	General Prime Contractor, and to provide all labor and material required for the construction of the project
30	designated above, for the prices hereinafter set forth, in strict accordance with the Bidding Documents
31	prepared by Potter Lawson, Inc., 749 University Row, Ste 300, Madison, WI 53705 for the Division of
32	Facilities Development and dated January 19, 2024.
33	racinites Development and dated January 19, 2024.
34	(For use by General Prime Contractor to offer subcontract to the successful MEP bidders identified by DFD)
35	(For use by General Prime Contractor to other subcontract to the successful MEP bidders identified by DFD)
36	
37	Contact Name: Norm Rivedal
	Contact Name
38	Telephone Number: 608.268.2138
39	reiephone Number: 000.200.2130
40	F 11.4.11
41	Email Address: <u>NRivedal@Hoopercorp.com</u>
42	T . V . 1
43	Fax Number:608.249.7360
44	
45	
46	IMPORTANT: BEFORE SUBMITTING YOUR BID, PLEASE VERIFY THAT:
47	1. You have been certified by DOA as a qualified and responsible bidder for the amount of your bid
48	within the division(s) of work being bid.
49	2. You have entered all Bid amounts in numeric characters (Example: \$9,999);
50	3. You have acknowledged receipt of all addenda;
51	4. You have signed the Bid Form
52	5. You have included a valid Bid Guarantee for not less than 10% of the value of the bid as either:
53	a) a Bid Bond signed by the contractor and surety, with a Power of Attorney attached, or
54 55	b) a Cashier's Check or Bank Check pursuant to Wis. Stat. s. 779.14(1m)(c)2.b. and 779.14(1s).
55	A Company or Personal Check will not be accepted.
56	

1	FIRE SUPPRESSION
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 2 Fire Suppression Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of (\$_1,474,690\)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instruction.
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	
11	

1	<u>PLUMBING</u>
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 3 Plumbing Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of (\$NA)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instruction.
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	
11	

1	HEATING, VENTILATING AND AIR CONDITIONING
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 4 Heating, Ventilating, Air Conditioning Work fully complete as per Bidding
4	Documents, for the sum of
5	
6	(\$ <u>NA</u>)
7	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions to Bidders
8	'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
9	
10	
11	

1	ELECTRICAL
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 5 Electrical Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents
4	
5	for the sum of (\$ NA)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instruction.
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	

1	COMBINED BASE	<u>BIDS (</u>	<u>PTION</u>	
2				
3	BASE BID NO	NA	for	(Division of Work),
4	BASE BID NO	NA	for	(Division of Work) and
5	BASE BID NO	NA	for	(Division of Work) and
6	BASE BID NO	NA	for	(Division of Work) Work fully complete as per
7	specifications and	related	drawings,	
8				
9	for the sum of (\$	NA)
0	En	ter bid	amount in	numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
1	to a	Bidders	'Article 1	5 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
2				
3				
4				

1	COMM	MENCEMENT AND COMPLETION OF WO	ORK
2	The un-	dersigned agrees, if identified as the lowest of	qualified responsible certified bidder for the divisions(s)
3			General Prime Contractor, and to commence the work
4			ce to Proceed issued by DFD to the General Prime
5			with the project schedule in the Instructions to Bidders.
	Comia	cior, and to complete the work in accordance	with the project schedule in the instructions to bidders.
6			
7		NDUM RECEIPT	
8	We ack	mowledge receipt of the following Addenda:	
9			
10	Adden	dum No. 001	Date February 15 2024
11	1100011		_DMCTCDIddiy 15, Z0Z1
	منتماه المالم	down No. 000	D.4. Halaman 27 2024
12	Adden	fum No. <u>002</u>	Date repruary 21, 2024
13			
14	Adden	fum No. 003	Date <u>March 1, 2024</u>
15			
16	Addend	dum No. <u>004</u>	Date March 26, 2024
17		-	
18	A ddan	ium No	Data
	Addend	talli 140,	_Date
19	BBIOB	TO GLOVING PIPER TO SUBTRIBLE OF SUBTRIBLE O	
20			S DIRECTED TO MEP INSTRUCTIONS TO
21	BIDDE	RS TO AVOID THE POSSIBILITY OF IN	VALIDATING THIS BID.
22			
23	BY SIC	ONING THIS BID FORM, THE BIDDER A	TTESTS TO PERSONAL KNOWLEDGE OF THE
24		OWING:	
25			
23		Dill 1 10 11 DO1 10 10	
	1.		nd responsible bidder for the amount of the bid
		submitted, within the division(s) of work b	eing bid.
	2.	Bidder agrees to enter into a subcontract w	ith the General Prime Contractor in accordance with
		Wis. Stats. s. 16.855(14) and ARTICLE 9	
		, in the second of the second	
	3.	Diddon has arraying the descripts and are	aifirations associates and the hid fame and has
	٥,		cifications, carefully prepared the bid form, and has
			ing bid; and bidder, or the agents, officers, or
			or indirectly, entered into any agreement, bid rigging,
		bid rotation, participated in any collusion,	or otherwise taken any action in restraint of free
		competitive bidding in connection with this	s bid.
	4.	That all work will the nerformed of the Ride	der's own proper cost and expense, that the Bidder will, machinery, apparatus, and other means of construction becifications, and at the time stated in the General Prime
	, ,	furnish all massacon Sateria a characteristics	machinery apparatus and other manns of construction
		Turnish an necessary materials paces, tools	, machinery, apparatus, and other means of construction
		in the manner provided dip the appreciate sh	ecifications, and at the time stated in the General Prime
		Contractor Olorice to Proceed. Z	
26		E CEAL	
27		SEAL	
28		\$ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \	Hooper Corporation
29		Nacore	(Firm Name)
30		111	(I II III I (ame)
		Contractor Olotice to Proceed. Z	Chanhan Millmann
31	/m	f bid is by a corporation with the state of	Stephen Millmann
32	(Seal, i	i did is by a corporationy	(Bidder's Printed Name)
33			1/1/2
34	Date: _	April 4, 2024	By Julian pulling
35			(Signature of Bidder)
36			, <u>,</u>
	ГЭ	TM	
37			d as a minority business enterprise or disabled veteran-
38		owned business by the Wisconsin Supplier	Diversity Program.

1	BID FORM – MECHANICAL, ELECTRICAL, PLUMBING, AND FIRE PROTECTION (MEP)
2	(Rev1/2023)
3	DIVISION OF FACILITIES DEVELOPMENT
4	s.16.855 Wis. Stats.
5	
6	NEW HEALTH AND SCIENCE BUILDING
7	UNIVERSITY OF WISCONSIN – EAU CLAIRE
8	EAU CLAIRE, WISCONSIN
9	,
10	Division Project No. 19J4E-02
11	Division Projectivo. 176411 va
12	
13	BID SUBMISSION DUE by 1:00PM, Mechanical, Electrical, Plumbing, and Fire Protection (MEP) Bid
14	Opening: 2:00 P.M., APRIL 4, 2024 - RESCHEDULED.
15	
16	To: State of Wisconsin, Department of Administration, Division of Facilities Development (a joint venture)
17	(a corporation)
18	— (a partnership)
19	We Hooper Corporation (an individual)
20	(Cross out inapplicable)
21	(Cross out mappineaoic)
22	
23	Of 6450 Pederson Crossing Blvd. DeForest, WI 53532-1613
24	
25	Street City County State Zip
26	hereby agree to execute a subcontract with the General Prime Contractor awarded the contract for the
27	project designated above and to furnish satisfactory separate 100% Performance Bond and 100% Payment
28	Bond in the amount specified no later than ten (10) days after execution of the subcontract with the
29	General Prime Contractor, and to provide all labor and material required for the construction of the project
30	designated above, for the prices hereinafter set forth, in strict accordance with the Bidding Documents
31	prepared by Potter Lawson, Inc., 749 University Row, Ste 300, Madison, WI 53705 for the Division of
32	Facilities Development and dated January 19, 2024.
33	1 definites Development and dated bandary 12, 2021.
34	(For use by General Prime Contractor to offer subcontract to the successful MEP bidders identified by DFD)
35	(For use by General Time Contractor to orier subcontract to the successful WEI bluders identified by DFD)
36	
37	Contact Name: Brian Schultz
38	Contact Haine. Di Lati Dollarez
	Telephone Number: (608) 268-2136
39	reichnolie Number
40	Email Address: DCahultz@hoonorgorn gom
41	Email Address: <u>BSchultz@hoopercorp.com</u>
42	Fax Number: (608) 249 – 7360
43	Fax Number:(000)249-7300
44	
45	
46	IMPORTANT: BEFORE SUBMITTING YOUR BID, PLEASE VERIFY THAT:
47	1. You have been certified by DOA as a qualified and responsible bidder for the amount of your bid
48	within the division(s) of work being bid.
49	2. You have entered all Bid amounts in numeric characters (Example: \$9,999);
50	3. You have acknowledged receipt of all addenda;
51	4. You have signed the Bid Form
52	5. You have included a valid Bid Guarantee for not less than 10% of the value of the bid as either:
53	a) a Bid Bond signed by the contractor and surety, with a Power of Attorney attached, or
54	b) a Cashier's Check or Bank Check pursuant to Wis. Stat. s. 779.14(1m)(c)2.b. and 779.14(1s).
55	A Company or Personal Check will not be accepted.
56	1

1	FIRE SUPPRESSION
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 2 Fire Suppression Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of (\$ No Bid)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	
11	

1	<u>PLUMBING</u>
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 3 Plumbing Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of (\$9, 894, 529)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	
11	

1	HEATING, VENTILATING AND AIR CONDITIONING
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 4 Heating, Ventilating, Air Conditioning Work fully complete as per Bidding
4	Documents, for the sum of
5	
6	(\$ No Bid)
7	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions to Bidders
8	'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
9	
10	
11	

1	ELECTRICAL
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 5 Electrical Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents
4	
5	for the sum of (\$ No Bid)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instruction.
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	

1	COMBINED BASE BIDS OPTION
2	
3	BASE BID NO. N/A for (Division of Work),
4	BASE BID NO. N/A for (Division of Work) and
5	BASE BID NON/A for(Division of Work) and
6	BASE BID NON/A_ for(Division of Work) Work fully complete as per
7	specifications and related drawings,
8	
9	for the sum of (\$ No Bid)
10	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
11	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
12	
13	
14	

on or	before a date to be	e specified in a writ	ten Notice to Pro	Prime Contractor, and to commence the work deced issued by DFD to the General Prime de project schedule in the Instructions to Bidd
	ENDUM RECEIP			
We a	icknowledge receip	ot of the following A	Addenda:	
Adde	endum No	1	Date	2/15/2024
Adde	endum No	2	Date	2/27/2024
Adde	endum No	3	Date	3/1/2024
Adde	endum No	4	Date	3/26/2024
BIDI BY S	DERS TO AVOID	THE POSSIBILITY	Y OF INVALID.	CTED TO MEP INSTRUCTIONS TO ATING THIS BID. S TO PERSONAL KNOWLEDGE OF THE
1.		fied by DOA as a quhin the division(s) o		onsible bidder for the amount of the bid
1. 2.	submitted, wit	hin the division(s) of to enter into a subco	of work being bid	
	Bidder agrees Wis. Stats. s. 1 Bidder has exa reviewed all for employees the bid rotation, pa	to enter into a subco 6.855(14) and ART umined the drawings orms in detail before reof, have not, eithe	of work being bid ontract with the CICLE 9 of these is and specification is submitting bid; or directly or indicultion, or other	l. General Prime Contractor in accordance with
 3. 4. 	Bidder agrees Wis. Stats. s. 1 Bidder has exa reviewed all for employees the bid rotation, pa competitive bi That all work furnish all more in the market	to enter into a subco 6.855(14) and ART umined the drawings orms in detail before reof, have not, eithe articipated in any co dding in connection will be performed at assary materials, lab	of work being bid ontract with the CICLE 9 of these is and specification is submitting bid; or directly or indiculation, or other is with this bid. It the Bidder's own or, tools, maching licable specificat	General Prime Contractor in accordance with Bidding Documents. ons, carefully prepared the bid form, and has and bidder, or the agents, officers, or rectly, entered into any agreement, bid riggin
 3. 4. 	Bidder agrees Wis. Stats. s. 1 Bidder has exa reviewed all for employees the bid rotation, pa competitive bi That all work furnish all more in the market	to enter into a subco 6.855(14) and ART umined the drawings orms in detail before reof, have not, eithe articipated in any co dding in connection will be performed at assary materials, lab	of work being bid ontract with the CICLE 9 of these is and specification is submitting bid; or directly or indiculation, or other is with this bid. It the Bidder's own or, tools, maching licable specificat	General Prime Contractor in accordance with Bidding Documents. ons, carefully prepared the bid form, and has and bidder, or the agents, officers, or rectly, entered into any agreement, bid riggin wise taken any action in restraint of free n proper cost and expense, that the Bidder we hery, apparatus, and other means of constructions, and at the time stated in the General Preservation (Firm Name)
 3. 4. 	Bidder agrees Wis. Stats. s. 1 Bidder has exa reviewed all for employees the bid rotation, pa competitive bi That all work furnish all more in the market	to enter into a subco 6.855(14) and ART umined the drawings orms in detail before reof, have not, eithe articipated in any co dding in connection will be performed at assary materials, lab	of work being bid ontract with the CICLE 9 of these is and specification is submitting bid; or directly or indiculation, or other is with this bid. It the Bidder's own or, tools, maching licable specificat	General Prime Contractor in accordance with Bidding Documents. ons, carefully prepared the bid form, and has and bidder, or the agents, officers, or rectly, entered into any agreement, bid riggin wise taken any action in restraint of free on proper cost and expense, that the Bidder was nery, apparatus, and other means of constructions, and at the time stated in the General Presentation.

C-7(REV2)

Place an "X" in the box if Bidder is certified as a minority business enterprise or disabled veteranowned business by the Wisconsin Supplier Diversity Program.

37

38

BID FORM - MECHANICAL, ELECTRICAL, PLUMBING, AND FIRE PROTECTION (MEP) (Rev1/2023) DIVISION OF FACILITIES DEVELOPMENT s.16.855 Wis. Stats. NEW HEALTH AND SCIENCE BUILDING UNIVERSITY OF WISCONSIN - EAU CLAIRE EAU CLAIRE, WISCONSIN Division Project No. 19J4E-02 BID SUBMISSION DUE by 1:00PM, Mechanical, Electrical, Plumbing, and Fire Protection (MEP) Bid Opening: 2:00 P.M., APRIL 4, 2024 - RESCHEDULED. To: State of Wisconsin, Department of Administration, Division of Facilities Development (a joint venture) (a corporation) (a partnership) (an individual) (Cross out inapplicable) Of 1267 LAKEShort Dr. E. Ashlano Ashlano WI 5480L

Street City County State Zip hereby agree to execute a subcontract with the General Prime Contractor awarded the contract for the project designated above and to furnish satisfactory separate 100% Performance Bond and 100% Payment Bond in the amount specified no later than ten (10) days after execution of the subcontract with the General Prime Contractor, and to provide all labor and material required for the construction of the project designated above, for the prices hereinafter set forth, in strict accordance with the Bidding Documents prepared by Potter Lawson, Inc., 749 University Row, Ste 300, Madison, WI 53705 for the Division of Facilities Development and dated January 19, 2024. (For use by General Prime Contractor to offer subcontract to the successful MEP bidders identified by DFD) Contact Name: Chris Kontny

Telephone Number: 715.682.3602

Email Address: Ckontnye Kbkservices.com Fax Number: _____7/5- 682-5850 IMPORTANT: BEFORE SUBMITTING YOUR BID, PLEASE VERIFY THAT: You have been certified by DOA as a qualified and responsible bidder for the amount of your bid within the division(s) of work being bid. You have entered all Bid amounts in numeric characters (Example: \$9,999); You have acknowledged receipt of all addenda; You have signed the Bid Form 5. You have included a valid Bid Guarantee for not less than 10% of the value of the bid as either: a) a Bid Bond signed by the contractor and surety, with a Power of Attorney attached, or b) a Cashier's Check or Bank Check pursuant to Wis. Stat. s. 779.14(1m)(c)2.b. and 779.14(1s). A Company or Personal Check will not be accepted.

1	FIRE SUPPRESSION
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 2 Fire Suppression Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of (\S)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
0	
11	

1	PLUMBING
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 3 Plumbing Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of ($\$$)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instruction
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
0	
1	

1	HEATING, VENTILATING AND AIR CONDITIONING
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 4 Heating, Ventilating, Air Conditioning Work fully complete as per Bidding
4	Documents, for the sum of
5	
6	(\$ <u>28,690.000</u>
7	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions to Bidders
8	'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
9	
10	
11	

1	ELECTRICAL
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 5 Electrical Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents
4	
5	for the sum of ($\$$)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	

1	COMBINED BASE BIDS	S OPTION		
2				
3	BASE BID NO	for	(Division of Work),	
4	BASE BID NO	for	(Division of Work) and	
5	BASE BID NO.	for	(Division of Work) and	
6	BASE BID NO.	for	(Division of Work) Work fully complete as per	
7	specifications and relate	ed drawings,		
8				
9	for the sum of (\$	N.A.)
10	Enter b	id amount in nume	eric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP In	nstructions
11	to Bidd	ers 'Article 15 Subi	mission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.	
12				
13				
14				

1	COMME	ENCEME	ENT AND COMPLETION	ON OF WORK			
2	The unde	ersigned a	agrees, if identified as th	e lowest quali	ified res	ponsible certified bidder f	or the divisions(s)
3						me Contractor, and to com	
4	on or bef	fore a dat	e to be specified in a wr	itten Notice to	Procee	d issued by DFD to the Ge	eneral Prime
5	Contract	or, and to	complete the work in a	ccordance wit	h the pr	oject schedule in the Instr	uctions to Bidders.
6							
7	ADDEN						
8	We ackn	owledge	receipt of the following	Addenda:			
9			1	_		7-15.74	
10	Addendu	ım No		Da	ite	2-15-24 2-27.24	
11		2.7	Z	D.	4	7-27 24	
12	Addendu	ım No		Da	ite	2.61.61	
13	A ddands	ım No	3	Da	ıto.	2-1-24	
14 15	Addendu	ım 190		Da		3-1-24 3-26-24	
16	A ddandi	ım No	4	Da	ite	3-26-24	
17	Addendi						
18	A ddendi	ım No		Da	nte.	·	
19	riddolldd		<u>.</u>			·	
20	PRIOR 7	ro sign	ING. BIDDERS' ATTE	NTION IS DI	RECTE	ED TO MEP INSTRUCTION	ONS TO
21			VOID THE POSSIBILI				
22							
23	BY SIGI	NING TH	HIS BID FORM, THE B	IDDER ATTI	ESTS T	O PERSONAL KNOWLE	EDGE OF THE
24	FOLLO	WING:					
25							
	1.					ible bidder for the amount	of the bid
		submitte	ed, within the division(s)	of work bein	g bid.		
	2.					eral Prime Contractor in a	ccordance with
		Wis. Sta	its. s. 16.855(14) and AI	RTICLE 9 of t	hese Bi	dding Documents.	
	3.					carefully prepared the bio	
						d bidder, or the agents, off	
						tly, entered into any agree	
			tion, participated in any tive bidding in connection			se taken any action in restr	ann or nee
		compen	tive blading in connection	on with this bi	a.		
	4.	That all	work will be performed	at the Ridder	e own r	proper cost and expense, th	at the Ridder will
	7.					y, apparatus, and other me	
		in the m	anner provided in the ar	mlicable speci	ification	is, and at the time stated in	the General Prime
,			tor's Notice to Proceed.	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,		,	
26	A MARIN	Vani		-			
27	K					10	
					r	KBK SERVICES INC.	
29				_		KBK SENVICES DNC. (Firm Name)	·
30	473	200					\circ
31	3 9 0			_		hnis Konthy (Bidder's Printed N	Mr.
32	-(Seal, if	bid is b	y a corporation)			(Bidder's Printed N	ame)
38 29 30 31 32 33 34		81.	1 21			00 111 0	
	Date:1	7-4	<u>-64</u>	_]	By((Signature of Bid	<u> </u>
35	111111111111111111111111111111111111111	A S				(Signature of Bid	der)
36	1.00	Ŷ					
37	[]	Place ar	"X" in the box if Bidde	er is certified a	s a min	ority business enterprise o	r disabled veteran-
38		owned l	business by the Wiscons	in Supplier D	iversity	Program.	

1 BID FORM - MECHANICAL, ELECTRICAL, PLUMBING, AND FIRE PROTECTION (MEP) 2 (Rev1/2023) DIVISION OF FACILITIES DEVELOPMENT 3 4 s.16.855 Wis. Stats. 5 6 NEW HEALTH AND SCIENCE BUILDING 7 UNIVERSITY OF WISCONSIN - EAU CLAIRE 8 EAU CLAIRE, WISCONSIN 9 10 Division Project No. 19J4E-02 11 12 13 BID SUBMISSION DUE by 1:00PM, Mechanical, Electrical, Plumbing, and Fire Protection (MEP) Bid 14 Opening: 2:00 P.M., APRIL 4, 2024 - RESCHEDULED. 15 16 To: State of Wisconsin, Department of Administration, Division of Facilities Development (a joint venture) 17 (a corporation) 18 We_____ B & B Electric, Inc. 19 20 21 22 Of 1303 Western Ave. Eau Claire, Eau Claire, WI 54703 23 24 Street City County State Zip 25 26 hereby agree to execute a subcontract with the General Prime Contractor awarded the contract for the 27 project designated above and to furnish satisfactory separate 100% Performance Bond and 100% Payment 28 Bond in the amount specified no later than ten (10) days after execution of the subcontract with the 29 General Prime Contractor, and to provide all labor and material required for the construction of the project 30 designated above, for the prices hereinafter set forth, in strict accordance with the Bidding Documents 31 prepared by Potter Lawson, Inc., 749 University Row, Ste 300, Madison, WI 53705 for the Division of 32 Facilities Development and dated January 19, 2024. 33 34 (For use by General Prime Contractor to offer subcontract to the successful MEP bidders identified by DFD) 35 36 Contact Name: Michael Bergh 37 38 Telephone Number: <u>715-832-1676</u> 39 40 Email Address: mb@b-belectricinc.com 41 42 Fax Number: ___ 715-832-1677 43 44 45 46 IMPORTANT: BEFORE SUBMITTING YOUR BID, PLEASE VERIFY THAT: 47 You have been certified by DOA as a qualified and responsible bidder for the amount of your bid 48 within the division(s) of work being bid. 49 You have entered all Bid amounts in numeric characters (Example: \$9,999); You have acknowledged receipt of all addenda; 50 3. 4. You have signed the Bid Form 51 You have included a valid Bid Guarantee for not less than 10% of the value of the bid as either: 52 53 a) a Bid Bond signed by the contractor and surety, with a Power of Attorney attached, or 54 b) a Cashier's Check or Bank Check pursuant to Wis. Stat. s. 779.14(1m)(c)2.b. and 779.14(1s). 55 A Company or Personal Check will not be accepted.

56

1	FIRE SUPPRESSION
2	·
3	BASE BID NO. 2 Fire Suppression Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of (\$
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
10	·
11	

1	PLUMBING
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 3 Plumbing Work fully complete as per Bidding Documents,
4	
5	for the sum of (\$)
6	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions
7	to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
8	
9	
0	
1	

1	HEATING, VENTILATING AND AIR CONDITIONING
2	
3	BASE BID NO. 4 Heating, Ventilating, Air Conditioning Work fully complete as per Bidding
4	Documents, for the sum of
5	
6	(\$)
7	Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions to Bidders
8	'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions.
9	
10	
11	

1	ELECTRICAL		
2			
3	BASE BID NO. 5 Electrical W	/ork fully complete as per Bidding Documents	
4			
5	for the sum of (\$	17,506,500.00)
6	Enter bid amou	ant in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999)). See MEP Instructions
7	to Bidders 'Arti	cle 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed insti	ructions.
8			
9			
-10			

COMBINED BASE BIDS OPTION 1 2 BASE BID NO. ______ for _____(Division of Work), 3 4 BASE BID NO. ______ for _____ (Division of Work) and 5 BASE BID NO. _____ for (Division of Work) and 6 for BASE BID NO. _____ (Division of Work) Work fully complete as per 7 specifications and related drawings, 8 9 for the sum of (\$ Enter bid amount in numeric characters only (Example: \$9,999). See MEP Instructions 10 to Bidders 'Article 15 Submission of Base Bids' for detailed instructions. 11 12 13 14

	NDUM RECEIF	PT ot of the following A	.ddenda:			
		1		February 15, 2024		
		2		February 27, 2024	_	
Adden	dum No	3	Date_	March 1, 2024		
Adden	dum No	4	Date_	March 26, 2024		
Adden	dum No		Date_			
PRIOR TO SIGNING, BIDDERS' ATTENTION IS DIRECTED TO MEP INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS TO AVOID THE POSSIBILITY OF INVALIDATING THIS BID. BY SIGNING THIS BID FORM, THE BIDDER ATTESTS TO PERSONAL KNOWLEDGE OF THE FOLLOWING:						
FOLL	JWING:					
1. Bidder is <u>certified</u> by DOA as a qualified and responsible bidder for the amount of the bid submitted, within the division(s) of work being bid.						
2.				General Prime Contractor i	n accordance with	
	wis. Stats. s.	16.855(14) and ARI	ICLE 9 of these	Bidding Documents.		
3.	Bidder has extreviewed all formployees the bid rotation, p	amined the drawings orms in detail before reof, have not, eithe	and specificati submitting bid r directly or ind llusion, or other	e Bidding Documents. ons, carefully prepared the ; and bidder, or the agents, irectly, entered into any agr rwise taken any action in re	officers, or eement, bid rigging,	
3.4.	Bidder has extreviewed all for employees the bid rotation, prompetitive bid That all work furnish all necession the manner	amined the drawings orms in detail before reof, have not, eithe articipated in any co idding in connection will be performed at essary materials, lab	and specificati submitting bid r directly or ind llusion, or other with this bid. the Bidder's ov or, tools, mach	ons, carefully prepared the ; and bidder, or the agents, irectly, entered into any agr	officers, or reement, bid rigging, straint of free that the Bidder will means of construction	
	Bidder has extreviewed all for employees the bid rotation, prompetitive bid That all work furnish all necession the manner	amined the drawings orms in detail before ereof, have not, either articipated in any condition will be performed at tessary materials, lab provided in the appl	and specificati submitting bid r directly or ind llusion, or other with this bid. the Bidder's ov or, tools, mach	ons, carefully prepared the grand bidder, or the agents, irectly, entered into any agreement taken any action in reconstruction in reconstruction of the proper cost and expense, inery, apparatus, and other attions, and at the time stated	officers, or reement, bid rigging, straint of free that the Bidder will means of construction in the General Prime	
	Bidder has extreviewed all for employees the bid rotation, prompetitive bid That all work furnish all necession the manner	amined the drawings orms in detail before ereof, have not, either articipated in any condition will be performed at tessary materials, lab provided in the appl	and specificati submitting bid r directly or ind llusion, or other with this bid. the Bidder's ov or, tools, mach	ons, carefully prepared the ; and bidder, or the agents, irectly, entered into any agreewise taken any action in rewise taken any action in rewin proper cost and expense, inery, apparatus, and other i	officers, or reement, bid rigging, straint of free that the Bidder will means of construction in the General Prime	
	Bidder has extreviewed all for employees the bid rotation, prompetitive bid That all work furnish all necession the manner	amined the drawings orms in detail before ereof, have not, either articipated in any condition will be performed at tessary materials, lab provided in the appl	and specificati submitting bid r directly or ind llusion, or other with this bid. the Bidder's ov or, tools, mach	ons, carefully prepared the and bidder, or the agents, irectly, entered into any agriculture taken any action in revise taken any action in revine proper cost and expense, inery, apparatus, and other ations, and at the time stated B&B Electric, (Firm Name)	that the Bidder will means of construction in the General Prime	
4.	Bidder has extreviewed all for employees the bid rotation, prompetitive bid That all work furnish all necession the manner	amined the drawings orms in detail before creof, have not, either articipated in any condition in connection will be performed at ressary materials, lab provided in the applacet to Proceed.	and specificati submitting bid r directly or ind llusion, or other with this bid. the Bidder's ov or, tools, mach	ons, carefully prepared the and bidder, or the agents, irectly, entered into any agreement taken any action in reconstruction of the agents of	that the Bidder will means of construction in the General Prime	